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JACKSON, Miss. – Dr. James Shwayder is the new chair of the University of Mississippi 
Medical Center Department of Obstetrics and Gynecology. 
 
Before joining UMMC, Shwayder was director of the Division of Gynecology and director 
of the fellowship in endoscopic surgery at the University of Louisville.    
 
Shwayder earned his medical degree at the University of Colorado Health Sciences 
Center and completed residency training in obstetrics and gynecology at Maricopa 
Medical Center in Phoenix, Ariz. From 1982-1998, he was in private practice in Virginia 
and academic practice at the University of Colorado. While in Virginia, he was a clinical 
associate professor at the Eastern Virginia Medical School.  
 
In 1998, he joined the University of Colorado Health Sciences Center and Denver Health 
Medical Center, where eventually he became the associate director of the Department of 
Obstetrics and Gynecology and director of gynecology and gynecologic ultrasound.  
Shwayder also earned the Doctor of Juris Prudence from the University of Denver College 
of Law in 2003. He joined the faculty at the University of Louisville in 2006.  
 
He is board-certified in obstetrics and gynecology and a fellow of the American College of 
Obstetrics and Gynecology. He is certified in advanced laparoscopy and hysteroscopy by 
the Accreditation Council on Gynecologic Endoscopy and serves as president of that 
organization. He has been a member of the AAGL (American Association of Gynecologic 
Laparoscopy) since 1981 and is on the board of trustees of the AAGL. He is also a fellow 
of the American Institute of Ultrasound in Medicine.  
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The University of Mississippi Medical Center, located in Jackson, is the state’s only 
academic medical center. University of Mississippi Health Care represents the clinical 
programs of the Medical Center and includes University Hospitals and Health System and 
University Physicians, the faculty group practice. UMMC encompasses five health science 
schools, including medicine, nursing, health related professions, dentistry and graduate 
studies, as well as the site where University of Mississippi pharmacy students do their 
clinical training. The Medical Center’s threefold mission is to educate tomorrow’s health-
care professionals, conduct innovative research to improve human health, and to provide 
the highest quality care available to the state’s citizens. A major goal of the Medical 
Center is the improvement of the health of Mississippians and the elimination of health 
disparities.  For more information, contact the Division of Public Affairs at 601-984-1100 
or visit us on the Web at http://publicaffairs.umc.edu/ 



 


